
STEPPING UP
We take the concepts and
strategies of the past 7 weeks
and put it all together.

COACHING #3
This session will fundamentally
change how you talk about
safety with employees.

WEEK 1INTRODUCTION 
We set up the program and 
introduce the CareFull
Supervisor theme and concept.

COACHING #1
We answer your questions
about the program and explore
the influencers in our lives.

FOCUS DOWN, NOT UP
Let's focus on where
supervisors have the greatest
amount of influence.

BUILD ELITE TEAMS
What will it take buld an elite
team? It requires elite level
supervisor skills. What are they?

KNOW YOUR ROLE
Supervisors have a very specific
role to play. What your team
depends on you for. 

PREMIUM-BRAND
We discuss what it takes to
become a premium-brand
supervisor.

WEEK 3

COACHING #2
We discuss what it takes to
build influence with teams and
identify premium-brand traits.

WEEK 4

SELLING SAFETY
We discuss the influence on safety
from supervisors and the tools to
sell the message of safety. 

WEEK 6

MOTIVATING TEAMS
Strategies and ideas to build
better team motivation and it
begins with self-motivation.
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WEEK 8

COACHING #4
We lean on motivation and ask
you to create a plan for your
next action steps.

WEEK 8
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How  It Works


